
Movers and Shakers 

Year 2   Summer 2    Medium Term Overview      2022/2023 

 

Autumn 1 Week 1 Week 2 Week 3 Week 4 Week 5 Week 6 

W/C 05.06.23 12.06.23 19.06.23 26.06.23 03.07.23 10.07.23 

Maths 
Statistics Statistics Position and Direction Position and Direction Position and Direction Position and Direction 

English 
 

Poetry 
Stories from around 

the world 
Stories from around 

the world 
Fact Files Fact Files Persuasive Posters 

R.E. 
Judaism – What 

special times and 
people do Jewish 
people remember 

and celebrate? 

What story do Jewish 
people remember and 
celebrate at Passover? 

What story do Jewish 
people remember and 

celebrate at Hanukkah? 

What is a mitzvah and 
why is it important for 

Jewish people? 

How do Jewish people 
feel that they belong? 

What is Tzedakah and 
why is it important for 
Jewish people? (sa-da-

kah) 

What is Tikkun Olam and 
why is it important for 

Jewish people? 

Science 
Plants Parts of a plant (recap) 

What plants/seeds can 
we find? 

Do seeds need water? 
Do all seeds germinate 

the same way? 
What temperature do 
plants need to grow? 

Do plants need light to 
grow? 

Topic/ 
Geography 

Let’s Explore the 
World! 

Using an atlas Compass directions Locating the equator Different climates Characteristics of the UK 
Comparison of UK and 

Somalia 

PHSE Jigsaw 
Changing Me Life Cycles in Nature 

Growing from young to 
old 

Recognising how their 
bodies have changed 

since they were a baby 

Physical differences 
between girls and boys 

(and what is private) 

Identifying touch they 
like and dislike 

Preparing for Year 3 – 
what am I looking 

forward to? 

P.E/ 
Forest School 

Recap rules and 
routines, exploring 

forest school 

Exploring plants and 
mini-beasts – link to 

seeds in Science 

Self-portraits using 
what they find in 

forest school 

Andy Goldsworthy – 
art using nature 

Measuring and shapes 
linked to what they 

find 

Using a BBQ to melt 
marshmallows 

Music 
Travel 

Explore movement in 
relation to music 

Using instruments to 
make a steady beat and 

rhythm.  

Preparing and improving 
a performance using 

movement, voice and 
percussion. 

   

DT/Art 
Food Tech 

To design a product 
following a simple brief 

(healthy smoothie) 

To make a product 
(smoothie) using a range 
of tools (cutting, grating) 

To evaluate the product 
(smoothie) and suggest 

improvements. 
 

 

 

Computing 
We Are 

Zooologists 

  
 Handling data Handling data Handling data 

 


